

# BID RESULTS FOR YEARLY SUPPLIES 2018

## ITEM 1: FIRE HYDRANTS

	CONSOLIDATED PIPE & SUPPLY CO	DIXIE WHOLESALE WATERWORKS	COBURN'S SUPPLY	CENTRAL PIPE SUPPLY	SOUTHERN PIPE & SUPPLY
	Jackson, MS	Louisville, MS	Richland, MS	PEARL, MS	RICHLAND, MS
	601-922-6600	662-773-8066	601-932-3668	800-844-7700	601-326-1700
	Mueller	M&H	M&H	M & H	M & H
3' BURY	\$1,425.00	\$1,275.00	\$1,172.36	\$1,190.00	\$1,196.00
4' BURY	\$1,450.00	\$1,330.00	\$1,229.48	\$1,230.00	\$1,254.00

## ITEM 2: MANHOLES

SOUTHERN PIPE & SUPPLY	
RICHLAND, MS	
601-326-1700	
Item	Unit Price
48" Diameter Reinforce Concrete Manhole Price per vertical foot	\$135.29
48" Type A Bottom	\$188.23
48" Type B Bottom with lip around outside 6" LIP	\$270.58
48" Flat Top	\$176.47
6" Kor-N Seal Boots	\$55.00
8" Kor-N Seal Boots	\$70.00
10" Kor-N Seal Boots	\$85.00
12" Kor-N Seal Boots	\$115.00
15" Kor-N Seal Boots	\$130.00

## ITEM 3: DEGREASER

LAMBERT INDUSTRIAL	
Forest, MS	
601-469-2806	
GP BREAKDOWN PLUS- 5 GALLON	\$17.00
GP BREAKDOWN PLUS- DRUM	\$16.75

### (A,B,C,D,E & G)

	HARCROS CHEMICAL	WATER TECH, INC	CARMEUSE LIME & STONE	FALCO LIME	UNIMIN LIME CORPORATION dba SOUTHERN LIME	IDEAL CHEMICAL & SUPPLY
	Vicksburg, MS	Fort Smith, AR	Pittsburgh, PA	Vicksburg, MS	Calera, AL	Memphis, TN
	601-630-4242	479-649-7447	412-995-1053	601-661-5019	205-668-6999	901-375-5536
	price per pound	price per pound	price per pound	price per pound	price per pound	price per pound
CHLORINE GAS - TON CONTAINER	\$0.4050					
SULFUR DIOXIDE - TON CONTAINER	\$0.7550					
SODIUM FLUORIDE 50# BAGS	\$0.8500					\$0.84
SODA ASH 50# BAGS	\$0.3225					
SODA ASH - BULK	\$0.2950					
HYDRATED LIME 50# BAGS	\$0.1725		\$0.156765	\$0.230400	\$0.1915	
HYDRATED LIME - BULK	\$0.1490		\$0.109850	\$0.091930	\$0.08980	
CALCIUM CHLORIDE 38% SLURRY MIX	\$0.1115	\$0.0720				
CALCIUM CHLORIDE 32% SLURRY MIX	\$0.0915	\$0.0720				\$0.087000
MINIMUM LOADS	47,000 SODA ASH 50,000 HYDRATED LIME 45,000 CALCIUM CHLORIDE	46,000 LBS	44,000 lb/bag 45,000 lb/bulk	22 TONS	22 TON BULK 25 TON BAG	Pallet Quantities (44 bags) 47,000 lbs

**ITEM 4: ENZYMES & BACTERIA (F)**

	<b>LAMBERT INDUSTRIAL</b>
	Forest, MS
	601-469-2806
HI COUNT LIQUID ENZYMES PRICE PER GALLON 5-GALLON PAIL	\$17.00
HI COUNT LIQUID ENZYMES PRICE PER GALLON DRUM	\$16.75

**ITEM 4: LIQUID FLUORIDE (H)**

	<b>IDEAL CHEMICAL &amp; SUPPLY</b>
	Memphis, TN
	901-375-5536
	HFS ACID 23%
15 GALLONS PER POUND	
15 GALLONS PER GALLON BULK	\$5.30 per lb 0.52
55 GALLONS PER POUND	
55 GALLONS PER GALLON BULK	\$4.27 per lb \$0.42

**ITEM 4: ALUMINUM SULFATE SOLUTION (I)**

	<b>WATER TECH, INC</b>	<b>IDEAL CHEMICAL &amp; SUPPLY</b>	<b>POLYTEC, INC</b>
	Fort Smith, AR	Memphis, TN	Mooreville, NC
	800-488-7451	901-375-5536	704-660-5195
	ALUMINUM SULFATE SOLUTION 48.5%	ALUMINUM SULFATE SOLUTION 48.5%	DT-100 Aluminum Suldate
Price per Pound	\$0.000000		
Price per Pound			
Bulk Price per Pound	\$0.0720	\$0.086	\$0.0718
		min 44,000 lbs	48 hour lead time; \$350.00 charge if 2 business days not given

**ITEM 4: SODIUM ALUMINATE SOLUTION (J)**

	<b>WATER TECH, INC</b>	<b>IDEAL CHEMICAL &amp; SUPPLY</b>	<b>POLYTEC, INC</b>
	Fort Smith, AR	Memphis, TN	Mooreville, NC
	800-488-7451	901-375-5536	704-660-5195
	SODIUM ALUMINATE SOLUTION 38%	SODIUM ALUMINATE SOLUTION 38%	PT-115
Price per Pound			
Bulk Price per Pound	\$0.1890	\$0.195000	\$0.1710
Price per Pound			
		min 44,000lbs	\$350.00 less than 48 hour lead time

**ITEM 4: HYDROCHLORIC ACID**

	HYDROCHLORIC ACID 36%
Price per Pound	no bid
Bulk Price per Pound	no bid

**ITEM 5A: ASPHALT (A, B, D AND E)**

	<b>W E BLAIN &amp; SONS, INC.</b>	<b>CUSTOM PAVING, INC.</b>	<b>DICKERSON &amp; BOWEN INC</b>	<b>ADCAMP</b>
	Mt Olive, MS 601-797-4551 601-732-8909	Lake, MS 601-536-2171 cell 601-917-3080	Brookhaven, MS 601-969-2002	JACKSON, MS 601-9394493
<b>MINIMUM LOAD</b>	400 TONS	300 TONS	300 TONS	300 TONS
<b>TOP COURSE</b>				
price per ton at plant	\$66.00		\$67.00	\$58.00
price per ton FOB Forest				\$72.00
price per ton in place + hauling fee + Asphalt	\$97.00			\$95.00
<b>BASE COURSE</b>				
price per ton at plant	\$57.00		\$65.00	\$55.00
price per ton FOB Forest				\$69.00
price per ton in place + hauling fee	\$89.00			\$92.00
<b>TACK</b>				
price per gallon	\$3.50			\$5.00
<b>LAYING ASPHALT</b>				
price per ton in place + hauling fee		\$24.00/ton		
<b>LAYING CHIP SEAL ONLY</b>				
	If at 7/1/2018 or any month ending after 7/1/2018, the industry wide cost index of petroleum products, including asphalt as published by MDOT in accordance with Senate Bill #2241 have increased by 10% over index at time of this bid, for fuel or asphalt, our hot mix asphalt price to you will be re-quoted to reflect this increase for the remainder of the quoted period.	Haul is included with placement as long as asphalt source is not more than 15 miles from Forest, Ms. If source of asphalt is further, after 15 miles rate for hauling is \$.20 per mile per ton.		

**ITEM 5B: BITUMIOUS EMULSION**

**NO BIDS**

**ITEM 5C: COLD MIX**

	<b>DICKERSON &amp; BOWEN</b>	<b>CENTRAL PIPE SUPPLY</b>	<b>W E BLAIN &amp; SONS, INC.</b>
	Brookhaven, MS 601-969-2002	PEARL, MS 601-939-3322	Mt Olive, MS 601-797-4551 601-732-8909
Price per ton FOB plant	\$95.00		\$130.00
Price per ton FOB Forest	\$110.00	\$545.00	

**ITEM 6: CULVERTS - A**

Southern Pipe and Supply				
Richland, Ms				
601-326-1700				
CLASS "C-III"				
(PRICE PER LF)	Concrete Round Pipe	Concrete Round Flared End Section	Concrete Arched Pipe	Concrete Arch Flared End Section
12"	\$13.00	n/b	no bid	no bid
15"	\$13.50	\$415.00	\$19.00	\$470.00
18"	\$16.40	\$415.00	\$23.00	\$470.00
24"	\$24.30	\$475.00	\$34.00	\$575.00
30"	\$34.90	\$565.00	\$48.25	\$650.00
36"	\$45.07	\$750.00	\$66.00	\$925.00
48"	\$79.10	\$1,600.00	\$118.00	\$1,750.00
60"	\$131.24	\$2,200.00	\$180.25	\$2,350.00
66"	\$230.00	n/b	no bid	no bid
72"	\$222.00	\$3,200.00	\$271.00	\$3,400.00

**ITEM 6: CULVERTS - B**

**NO BIDS**

**ITEM 6: CULVERTS - C & D**

	G&O SUPPLY CO	COBURN SUPPLY	CENTRAL PIPE SUPPLY	Southern Pine and supply
	Jackson, MS	Richland, MS 39218	PEARL, MS	Richland, Mississippi
	601-421-8926 (Davis) 601-366-7444	601-932-3668	601-939-3322	601-326-1700
	POLYETHYLENE PIPE	POLYETHYLENE PIPE	POLYETHYLENE PIPE	Polyethylene pipe
Size of Pipe	price per foot	price per foot	price per foot	Price per foot
12"	\$5.63	\$5.63	\$5.63	\$5.63
15"	\$7.61	\$7.61	\$7.61	\$7.61
18"	\$10.01	\$10.01	\$10.01	\$10.01
24"	\$16.81	\$16.81	\$16.81	\$16.81
30"	\$24.61	\$24.61	\$24.61	24.61
36"	\$30.56	\$30.56	\$30.56	30.56
48"	\$48.84	\$48.84	\$48.84	48.84
60"	\$89.42	\$89.42	\$89.42	89.42
66"	no bid	n/a	no bid	No-bid
72"	no bid	n/a	no bid	No. Bid

	G&O SUPPLY CO	COBURN SUPPLY	CENTRAL PIPE SUPPLY	Southern Pine and supply
	Jackson, MS	Richland, MS 39218	PEARL, MS	Richland, Mississippi
	601-421-8926 (Davis) 601-366-7444	601-932-3668	601-939-3322	601-326-1700
	HP POLYPROPYLENE PIPE	HP POLYPROPYLENE PIPE	HP POLYPROPYLENE PIPE	HP POLYPROPYLENE PIPE
Size of Pipe				
12"	\$6.99	\$6.99	\$6.99	\$6.99
15"	\$8.73	\$8.73	\$8.73	\$8.73
18"	\$11.12	\$11.12	\$11.12	\$11.12
24"	\$18.74	\$18.74	\$18.74	\$18.74
30"	\$29.11	\$29.11	\$29.11	\$29.11
36"	\$31.91	\$31.91	\$31.91	\$31.91
48"	\$53.79	\$53.79	\$53.79	\$53.79
60"	\$87.33	\$87.33	\$87.33	\$87.33
66"	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
72"	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid

**ITEM 6: CULVERTS - E**

		<b>G &amp; O SUPPLY CO, INC</b>			<b>Southern Pine and supply</b>	
		Jackson, MS			Richland, Mississippi	
		601-421-8926 / 601-366-7444			601-326-1700	
<b>Size of Pipe</b>		Metal Coated Pipe Asphalt Coated	Metal Coated Pipe Aluminized Coated	Metal Uncoated Pipe Galvanized	Metal Coated Pipe	Metal Uncoated Pipe
		price per foot	price per foot	price per foot	price per foot	price per foot
12"	16ga	\$12.12	\$9.83	\$9.36	\$12.12	16 Gauge 9.36
15"	16ga	\$15.37	\$11.79	\$11.23	\$15.37	16 Ga 11.23
18"	16ga	\$19.56	\$14.74	\$14.04	\$19.56	16 Ga 14.04
24"	16ga	\$24.69	\$18.67	\$17.78	\$24.69	16 Ga 17.78
30"	16ga	\$31.44	\$23.59	\$22.46	\$31.44	16 Ga 22.46
36"	16ga	\$36.81	\$28.50	\$27.14	\$36.81	16 Ga 27.14
48"	16ga	\$51.15	\$39.22	\$37.35	\$51.15	16 Ga 37.35
60"	12ga	\$102.45	\$87.56	\$83.40	14 Ga 89.36	14 Ga 68.98
66"	12ga	\$111.51	\$96.22	\$91.63	14 Ga 103.8	14 Ga 76.19
72"	10ga	\$160.20	\$155.94	\$137.01	14 Ga 120.59	14 Ga 90.22

		<b>COBURN SUPPLY</b>	
		Richland, MS 39218	
		601-932-3668	
<b>Size of Pipe</b>		Metal Asphalt Coated Pipe	Metal Galv. Uncoated Pipe
		Corrugation 2 2/3 x 1/2	Corrugation 2 2/3 x 1/2
		price per foot	price per foot
12"	16ga	\$12.12	\$9.36
15"	16ga	\$15.37	\$11.23
18"	16ga	\$19.56	\$14.04
24"	14ga	\$24.69	\$22.46
30"	14ga	\$31.44	\$28.08
36"	12ga	\$55.53	\$45.86
48"	12ga	\$77.69	\$63.88
60"	10ga	\$125.10	\$106.05
66"	10ga	\$136.22	\$116.34
72"	10ga	\$160.20	\$137.01

**ITEM 7: AGGREGATE**

	<b>SHANNON HARMON TRUCKING</b>	<b>VULCAN MATERIALS CO</b>	<b>W E BLAIN &amp; SONS, INC.</b>
	Lake, MS	Meridian, MS	Mt Olive, MS
	601-507-2777	800-814-9242 office 601-703-0557 yard	601-797-4551 601-732-8909
Slag-county mat	\$46.50		
Crushed limestone #3 FOB FOREST	\$42.00	#24 \$43.50	
Crushed limestone #5 FOB FOREST	\$42.00	\$43.50	
Crushed limestone #7 FOB FOREST	\$43.00	\$45.00	
Crushed limestone #9	\$43.00	#89 \$45.00	
Crushed limestone #610	\$42.00	\$43.50	
Washed gravel all sizes & types	\$33.50		<b>\$32.00</b>
Rip-rap all sizes and types FOB Forest	\$55.00	\$52.00	
Minimum order			

**ITEM 8: SAND & CLAY GRAVEL**

	<b>SHANNON HARMON</b>	<b>W E BLAIN &amp; SONS, INC.</b>
	Lake, MS	Mt Olive, MS
	601-507-2777	601-797-4551 601-732-8909
	price per cubic yard	
River sand	\$8.00	
Masonry sand	\$33.00	\$34.00
Clay gravel	\$13.00	
Clay topping	\$6.50	

**ITEM 9: MOSQUITO CONTROL**

	<b>ADAPCO</b>	<b>CLARKE MOSQUITO CONTROL PRODUCTS</b>	<b>Allpro Vector Group</b>
	Sanford, FL	St Charles, IL	Northville, Mi
	800-367-0659	800-323-5727	248-773-7460
	PER GALLON PER DRUM	PER GALLON PER DRUM	PER GALLON PER DRUM
BIOMIST 30+30 PRICE PER GALLON CONCENTRATED		\$61.00	
ENVIROTECH OIL PRICE PER GALLON		\$7.15	
MOSQUITOMASTER 412 PRICE PER GALLON		\$44.00	
PERMANONE 3030 CONCENTRATED MIXTURE PRICE PER GALLON	\$66.94		
PERMANONE 31-66 CONCENTRATED MIXTURE PRICE PER GALLON	\$100.00		
AQUA-PERM-X UL 30-30 55 GALLON DRUM PRICE PER GALLON	\$111.25		
PURSUIT 31-67 (55GL DR)	88.76/CM		
PURSUIT 4-4 55 GALLON DRUM CONCENTRATED MIXTURE PRICE PER GALLON	\$18.25		
EVOLUER 30-30			\$64.95
MINERAL OIL			\$6.95
FYANON ULV MOSQUITO /RTU/CM	\$55.19		
CALPAR 80 ULV	RTU/6.49 -- CM/6.78		

**ITEM 10: BULK FUEL**

	<b>CAPITAL OIL, INC.</b>	<b>JOHN G. WEATHERFORD INC</b>
	Jackson, MS	FOREST, MS
	601-932-6868	601-469-3931
	COST +	COST +
REGULAR UNLEADED	\$0.225640	0.220000
DIESEL HIGHWAY	\$0.232140	0.225000
DIESEL OFF ROAD	\$0.117140	0.110000
	Bulk Delivery Only	

**ITEM 11: BANKS**

	<b>DEPOSITORY</b>	<b>CD RATE</b>	<b>CHECKING</b>
BANK OF FOREST	50%	1.03%	0.67
COMMUNITY BANK	50%	1.03%	0.67
CITIZENS BANK		0.55%	0.55

**ITEM 12: CONCRETE**

<b>MMC MATERIALS, INC</b>				
Forest, MS				
601-469-2741				
	<b>Pea Gravel</b>	<b>Large Rock</b>	<b>Fiber</b>	<b>Industrial Fiber</b>
	Price per yard	Price per yard	Price per yard	Price per yard
3000 pound	\$121.00	\$118.00	\$5.00 per cubic yard	\$5.00 per pound
4000 pound	\$126.00	\$123.00	\$5.00 per cubic yard	\$5.00 per pound
Hauling fee for minimum yards	\$100.00 less the 5 yards	\$100.00 less the 5 yards	\$100.00 less the 5 yards	\$100.00 less the 5 yards

**ITEM 13: ASPHALT MILLING**

	<b>DELTA CONSTRUCTORS</b>	<b>ADCAMP</b>
	Jackson, MS	JACKSON, MS
	601-939-8732	601-9394493
	per square yard	per square yard
Asphalt grinding and milling 0 to 2"	\$1.20	\$2.50
Asphalt grinding and milling 2" to 4"	\$1.44	\$3.50
MOBILIZATION TO CITY OF FOREST	\$1,400.00	\$1,500.00

**ITEM 14: UNIFORM/FLOOR MAT RENTAL**

<b>CINTAS</b>			
Jackson, MS			
601-366-0667			
DESCRIPTION	WEEKLY	MONTHLY	REPLACEMENT COST
WORK SHIRTS	\$1.65	\$6.60	\$15.00
WORK PANTS	\$1.95	\$7.80	\$18.00
JACKET	\$0.83	\$3.32	\$30.00
LAB COATS	\$0.18	\$0.72	\$30.00
2x3 FLOOR MAT	\$2.14	\$8.56	\$30.00
3x5 FLOOR MAT	\$2.04	\$8.16	\$45.00
4x6 FLOOR MAT	\$2.50	\$10.00	\$70.00
Men's Cargo Pants \$2.95 per week /Men's Jeans \$2.95 per week			

**ITEM 15: WIRELESS SCADA SYSTEM**

<b>SCOGGINS PUMP REPAIR</b>		
Richland, MS		
601-939-4651		
SOFTWARE	WATER WELL	SEWER LIFT STATION
HARDWARE	\$3,900.00	\$3,500.00
INSTALLATION COST	\$1,200.00	\$1,000.00
YEARLY MONITORING	\$799.00	\$799.00