BID RESULTS FOR YEARLY SUPPLIES 2025

ITEM 1: CHLORINE, SULFUR DIOXIDE , SODIUM FLUORIDE, HYDRATED LIME

HARCROS MISSISSIPPI LIME
CHEMICAL COMPANY
Vicksburg, MS St. Louis, MO
601-260-3383 800-437-5463
Price per pound Price per pound
CHLORINE GAS - R
TON CONTAINER 1.04* No Bid Q1 Only
SULFUR DIOXIDE - .
TON CONTAINER 1.16* No Bid Q1 Only
SODIUM FLUORIDE " .
(50 Ib bags) 2.69 No Bid Q1 Only
HYDRATED LIME "
(50 Ib bags) 0.46 $0.2927 Q1 Only
A YDRATED LIME - No Bid $0.275385
ITEM 2: CALCIUM CHLORIDE
HARCROS
CHEMICAL WATER TECH, INC
Vicksburg, MS Fort Smith, AR
601-260-3383 479-649-7447
CALCIUM CHLORIDE : .
38% SLURRY MIX No Bid No Bid
CALCIUM CHLORIDE - o
290 SLURRY MIX 0.133 0.135 Q1 Only
MINIMUM LOADS 45,000 Ibs
ITEM 3: ALUMINUM SULFATE & SODIUM ALUMINATE
WATER TECH, INC Southern lonics Inc.
Fort Smith, AR West Point, MS
479-649-7447 662-494-3055
ALUMINUM SULFATE $0.1200 $0.1164
SODIUM ALUMINATE $0.3150 $0.2700
ITEM 4: SLUDGE REMOVAL
DENALI WATER
SOLUTIONSLLC.
RUSSELLVILLE, AR
479-498-0500
400,000 gal/lump sum
$49,500.00
.12375/Gallon
John G.
WEATHERFORD,
ITEM5: BULK FUEL Inc.
Forest, MS
601-469-3931
COST +
REGULAR UNLEADED $0.20
DIESEL HIGHWAY $0.20
DIESEL OFF ROAD $0.20
ITEM 6: FIRE HYDRANTS
CENTRAL PIPE
SUPPLY
Peart, IS
601-939-3322
M&H
3’ BURY $2,581.92
4> BURY $2,707.71
ITEM 7: ASPHALT
APAC CUSTOM PAVING, INC
Mt Olive, MS Lake, MS
601-940-9240 601-536-2171
TOP COURSE
price per ton FOB plant HIOBTE
BASE COURSE
price per ton FOB plant STy
CAYING ASPHALT A
price per ton in place No Bid $36.00
ITEM 8: AGGREGATE
SHANNON
HARMON
TRUCKING APAC
Lake, MS Richland, MS
Crushed limestone #5 $79.00 No Bid
Crushed limestone #7 $79.00 No Bid
Crushed limestone #610 $77.00
Rip-rap all sizes and types $90.00 $74.00 ]
Gabion Rocks $90.00
ITEM 10: SOIL MATERIAL
SHANNON
HARMON
Lake, MS
601-507-2777
River sand $10.00
Clay gravel $22.00
Clay topping $8.50




